ABSTRACT OF BIDS

| CERTIFY that | have opened, re:

Signature:

¢l

and recorded herein all bids received and listed below:

CL/RFP Number

Page _1 y

Bidder Number

Bidder Number

Bidder Number

Mowing & Litter Control

CL24-014 of 1 2 3
1 Respon_sive Respon_sive Non-Responsive
CL/RFP Title Date Opened: F & W Tree Company Jett Energy Tahah Lawncare & Landscaping LLC

March 6, 2024

Dillon White
507 W Harper
Fletcher, OK 73541
580-678-1001
Dwhitelawn@gmail.com

Steve Perkins
P.O. Box 113
Duncan, OK 73534
580-470-5985
sp@jettenergy.net

Aaron Tahah
626 SW Landmark Circle
Geronimo, OK 73543
580-585-2295
tahahlandl@gmail.com

Fincancial Services: Buyer Number of ADDENDA Issued Addenda Acknowledged Addenda Acknowledged Addenda Acknowledged
Colbie Garrett 1 Yes Yes No
DELIVERY: As required As required As required
CORPORATE SEAL OR NOTARY: Yes Yes No
AFFIDAVIT OF PAYMENTS....$25,000: Yes Yes Yes
CONTRACTOR'S CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE Yes Yes Yes
Bid Option 1
Monthly Cost to Bid Option 2 Bid Option 1 Bid Option 2 Bid Option 1 Bid Option 2
Provide Monthly Cost to Provide Monthly Cost to Monthly Cost to Monthly Cost to Mmo
ONLY Mowing, ALL Requested Services| Provide Provide Provide Pro {le ALL
Trimming Listed Under ONLY Mowing, ALL Requested | ONLY Mowing, [ “TOV¢E " |
Item No. Description of Bid Item Unit and Litter Control "Specifications" for all Trimming Services Trimming qf‘sted Underl
Services twelve (12) months and Litter Control Listed Under and Litter Control g elc'f'carons" for
for all twelve (12) | (MONTHLY AVERAGE) Services "Specifications" for Services pecifl a"'
Months SEE BID RESULTS FOR] for all twelve (12) all for all twelve (12) twelve (12) months
(MONTHLY AVERAGE) DETAILS Months twelve (12) months Months welv
SEE BID RESULTS FOR]
1 AE L TR Per Month $53,000.00 $54,750.00 $52,000.00 $60,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Rights-of-Way
2 (Area 2: Major N-S Street Medians and Per Month $41,833.33 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $54,000.00 No Bid No Bid
Rights-of-Way
3 (Area 3: Neighborhood Medians Per Month $4,812.50 $5,100.00 $5,800.00 $6,700.00 $6,500.00 $6,200.00
4 Area 4: City Owned Vacant Lots Per Month $3,500.00 $4,000.00 $5,700.00 $5,900.00 $5,500.00 $5,300.00
5 Area 5: City Owned Facilities Per Month $19,958.33 $21,000.00 $26,500.00 $34,000.00 No Bid No Bid
6 Area 6: Drainage Areas Per Month $135,833.33 $165,000.00 $169,000.00 $205,000.00 No Bid No Bid

CL/RFP Number

Bidder Number

Bidder Number

Bidder Number

Bidder Number

CL24-014 4 5 6 7
Responsive Responsive Responsive Responsive
CL/R? Title Sonrise Adult & 'Fen Challenge Gray's Lawnca_re Service Lawn erds 7XL Land & Cam Company
Mowing & Litter Control Brian Monroe Justin Gray Rene Gotiear-Bailey Tom Milam
19792 NW Cache Rd 6606 NW Willw Tree Cir 170 NW Lakeview Place P.O. Box 874

Cache, OK 73527

580-351-447

Brian.Monroe@okteenchallenge.com

Lawton, OK 3505

915-494-1801

GraysLawnCareServiceLLC@gmail.com

Lawton, OK 73507

580-583-8089
renedgotiear@hotmail.com

Dunacn, OK 73534

580-467-8420
Tom@hot-linellc.com

Number of ADDENDA Issued Addenda Acknowledged Addenda Acknowledged Addenda Acknowledged Addenda Acknowledged
1 Yes No Yes Yes
DELIVERY: As required As required As required As required
CORPORATE SEAL OR NOTARY: Yes Yes Yes Yes
[AFFIDAVIT OF PAYMENTS....$25,000: Yes Yes Yes Yes
CONTRACTOR'S CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE Yes Yes Yes Yes
- - Bid Option 1. Bid Option 2 Bid Option 1 Bid Option 2
Bid Option 1 Bid Option 2 . . N . Monthly Cost to
Monthly Cost to Monthly Cost to Bid Option 1 Bid Option 2 Provide Monthly Cost to Monthly Cost to Monthly Cost to
N Y N y Monthly Cost to Monthly Cost to Provide " N Provide ALL Provide ONLY Provide ALL
Provide ONLY Mowing| Provide ALL N N N ONLY Mowing, N N .
- . . N . N N Provide ONLY Mowing, JALL Requested Services| N . Requested Services Mowing, Requested Services|
Description of Bid Item Unit Trimming, and Litter | Requested Services N . N . Trimming 3 N N .
N . Trimming, and Litter Listed Under N Listed Under Trimming, and Listed Under
Control Services for all Listed Under . P and Litter Control e . e
" e Control Services for all] "Specifications" for all N "Specifications" for Litter Control "Specifications" for]
twelve (12) Months 'Specifications" for all Services N
twelve (12) months twelve (12) Months twelve (12) months for all twelve (12) all Services for all all
M::nr:’s twelve (12) months |twelve (12) Months twelve (12) months
Area 1: Major E-W Street Medians. . . A a
and Rights-of-Way Per Month $54,000.00 $74,000.00 No Bid No Bid $57,000.00 $77,000.00 No Bid No Bid
(Area 2: Major N-S Street Medians Per Month $49,000.00 $66,500.00 No Bid No Bid $45,500.00 $63,000.00 No Bid No Bid
and Rights-of-Way
Area 3: Neighborhood Medians Per Month $4,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,123.81 $7,961.77 $5,600.00 $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid
Area 4: City Owned Vacant Lots Per Month $5,600.00 $6,900.00 $3,698.61 $5,121.81 $5,000.00 $6,200.00 $6,950.00 $8,200.00
(Area 5: City Owned Facilities Per Month $11,000.00 $21,000.00 No Bid No Bid $17,500.00 $21,500.00 $35,370.00 $36,620.00
(Area 6: Drainage Areas Per Month $58,000.00 $78,000.00 No Bid No Bid $63,000.00 $82,500.00 $278,654.00 $292,491.50




