| CERTIFY that | have opened, read, and recorded herein all bids received and listed below:

ABSTRACT OF BIDS __signature: Freevrara
CL/RFP Number Page _1 7 Biddepﬁumber Bidder Number Bidder Number
CL23-026 of 1 ) 3
3
IFB/RFP Title Date Opened: City of Lawton Parks & Jett Energy, LLC. Sonrise Adult & Teen

Mowing & Litter

Rec/Drainage Maintenance

Christine James, Director

Steve Perkins

Challenge of Ok

Brian Monroe

May 2, 2023 1405 SW 11th St PO Box 113 19792 NW Cache Rd
Lawton, OK 73501 Duncan, OK 73534 Cache, OK 73527
580-581-3400 580-470-5985 580-351-7447
christine.james@Ilawtonok.gov sp@jettenergy.net brian.monroe @okteenchalleng
e.com
L Number of
Accountant/Buyer/Contract Administrator ADDENDA Issued Addenda Acknowledged Addenda Acknowledged Addenda Acknowledged
Justine Guevara NONE N/A N/A N/A
DELIVERY: As required As required As required
CURFURAIC ODCAL Ut Yes Yes Yes
NATLRY 1 ur
PAVMENTS @28 NNN- Yes Yes Yes
CERTIFICATE ENCLOSED: N/A N/A N/A
Item No. Description of Bid Item Estt. Unit Bid Option Bid Option Bid Option Bid Option Bid Option Bid Option
Qty 1 2 1 2 1 2
1 Major E-W Street Medians/ROW per month $17,745.63 $17,75463 | . $68,500.00 | $58,500.00
2 Major N-S Street Medians/ROW per month $17,754.60 $17,75463 | VO T $59,300.00 | $56,100.00
3 |Neighborhood Medians per month $5,918.21 $5,918.21 SIS $6,900.00 | $6,100.00
4 City Owned Vacant Lots per month $5,918.21 $5,918.21 cost. $6,900.00 $6,400.00
5 City Facilities per month $5,918.21 $5,918.21 NO BID NO BID
6 Drainage Areas per month $41,020.17 $41,020.17 NO BID NO BID
CL/RFP Number Page _2 Bidder Number Bidder Number Bidder Number
CL23-026 of 4 5 6
3
IFB/RFP Title Date Opened: XL Land & Eitéle Company, Solutions, LLC. Hot-Shot Services, LLC.
Mowing & Litter Tom Milam Tom Milam Tom Milam
May 2, 2023 PO Box 874 PO Box 874 PO Box 874
Duncan, OK 73534 Duncan, OK 73534 Duncan, OK 73534
580-467-8420 580-467-8420 580-467-8420
tom@hot-linellc.com tom@hot-linellc.com tom@hot-linellc.com
— Number of
Accountant/Buyer/Contract Administrator ADDENDA Issued Addenda Acknowledged Addenda Acknowledged Addenda Acknowledged
Justine Guevara NONE N/A N/A N/A
DELIVERY: As required As required As required
CURFURAILC ODCAL UK Yes Yes Yes
NATERY U v v v
DAVMENTQ @28 NNN- es es es
CERTIFICATE ENCLOSED: Yes Yes Yes
1tem No. Description of Bid Item I(E;t Unit Bid Option Bid Option Bid Option Bid Option Bid Option Bid Option
y 1 2 1 2 1 2
1 Major E-W Street Medians/ROW per month NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2 Major N-S Street Medians/ROW per month NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 Neighborhood Medians per month NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
4 City Owned Vacant Lots per month $12,160.00 $11,560.00 $12,153.00 $11,558.00 $12,160.00 | $11,560.00
5 City Facilities per month $29,380.00 $35,370.00 $29,373.00 $35,368.00 $29,380.00 $35,370.00
6 Drainage Areas per month $213,960.00 | $174,699.00 ] $213,952.00 | $174,696.00 | $213,960.00 ]| $174,699.00
CL/RFP Number Page _3 Bidder Number
CL23-026 of _7
3
IFB/RFP Title Date Opened: Lawn Wizard
Mowing & Litter Rene Gotiear
May 2, 2023 170 NW Lakeview Place




Lawton, OK 73507
580-583-8089

renedgotiear@hotmail.com

Accountant/Buyer/Contract Administrator

Number of

ADDENDA Issued

Addenda Acknowledged

Justine Guevara NONE N/A
DELIVERY: As required
CURFURAILC ODCAL UK Yes
NATERY U v
DAVMENTQ ®2E NNN- es
CERTIFICATE ENCLOSED: No
Item No. Description of Bid Iltem Est. Unit Bid Option Bid Option
Qty 1 2
1 Major E-W Street Medians/ROW per month $69,600.00 $60,100.00
2 Major N-S Street Medians/ROW per month $55,500.00 $52,000.00
3 Neighborhood Medians per month $7,000.00 $6,500.00
4 City Owned Vacant Lots per month $6,100.00 $5,850.00
5 City Facilities per month NO BID NO BID
6 Drainage Areas per month NO BID NO BID
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