City of Lawton
INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT

MAIL SEALED BIDS TO: DIRECT INQUIRIES TO:

City Clerk justine.guevara@lawtonok.gov

City of Lawton

212 SW gth Street QUESTIONS REGARDING BID:

Lawton, OK 73501 www.bidsync.com/bidsync-cas/
Date Bid Typed: Dates Bid Advertised: No Bids Received After:
April 12, 2023 April 14, 2023 May 2, 2023 2:00pm
Contract Number and Title: Requirements-type Contract: Contract Period:
CL23-026 Mowing & Litter 12 months

Bid Openings are held at Lawton City Hall 2nd Floor Conference Room

212 SW 9* Street Lawton, OK 73501 @ 2:00 pm

Vendor Name and Point of Contact: Reason for No Bid:
City of Lawton Parks and Recreation /Drainage Maintenance Divisions
Christine James, Parks and Recreation Director

Mailing Address: Terms:
1405 SW 11th Street

City: State: Zip: Delivery:
Lawton OK 73501
Area Code and Phone Number: Email Address:
580-581-3400 christine. james@lawtonok.gov
Federal Employer ldentification Number or Social Security Number
73-6005287

THIS BID INVALID IF NOT SIGNED AND NOTARIZED
AFFIDAVIT: STATE OF ___Oklahoma COUNTY OF Comanche ;

Christine James of lawful age, being first duly sworn, on oath says that:

1. Affiant is the duly authorized agent of the bidder/vendor and/or contractor submitting the competitive bid and executing the contract which is attached to this
statement, and that as such agent Affiant has the authority to bind the bidder/vendor, whether an individual, partnership, or carporation, for the purpose of negotiating
and entering into said agreement, and for certifying the facts pertaining to the existence of collusion among bidders and between bidders and City officials or
employees, as well as facts pertaining to the giving or offering of things of value to government personnel in return for special consideration in the letting of any
contract pursuant to the bid to which this statement is attached; 2. Affiant is fully aware of the facts and circumstances surrounding the making of the bid and/or the
procurement of the contract to which this statement is attached and has been personally and directly involved in the proceedings leading to the submission of such
bids; 3. Neither the bidder/vendor nor anyone subject to the bidder/vendor’s direction or control has been a party: a. to any collusion among bidders in restraint of
freedom of competition by agreement to bid at a fixed price or to refrain from bidding, b. to any collusion with any municipal official or employee as to quantity, quality
or price in the prospective contract, or as to any other terms of such prospective contract, c. in any discussions between bidders and any municipal official concerning
exchange of money or other thing of value for special consideration in the letting of a contract, nor d. to paying, giving or donating or agreeing to pay, give or donate
to any officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any money or other thing of value, either directly or indirectly, in procuring the contract to which his statement is
attached. 4. Affiant further agrees to be held personally liable in the event that Affiant has misrepresented the scope or extend of Affiant's authority to bind the bidder
herein, and to indemnify and hold harmless the City of Lawton its departments, boards, commissions, agencies, institutions, and all employees of the aforementioned
from all damages based upon such misrepresentation, including but not limited to all costs and attorn es inclrred, in addltldn to any other remedies available by
law.

—

‘—//éleNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT
City of Lawton Parks and Recreation/Drainage Maintenance Divisions Christiné Jafmes, Parks and Recreation Director
PRINT/TYPE NAME/TITLE

Address: 1405 SW 11th Street .
Subscribed & sworn before me this aﬂ day offlp_\'_\i;. 20 25 _

Lawton, OK 73501
(City, State, Zip)

Firm:

ry PUb|IC
Phone:-—580-361-3400 My Commission expires: ( )9" L\
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PAGE 1 OF 11 7 NOTARY PUBLIC State of OK

KRISTY DEMENT
Comm. # 19001291
FORM REVISED 2/14/22 Exp. 02-04-2027
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AFFIDAVIT FOR PAYMENTS IN EXCESS OF $25,000.00
CITY OF LAWTON, STATE OF OKLAHOMA

STATEOF Oklahoma

SS
COUNTY OF  Comanche

The undersigned (architect, contractor, supplier or engineer), of lawful age, being first duly sworn,
on oath says that this contract is true and correct. Affiant further states that the (work, services or materials)
will be (completed or supplied) in accordance with the plans, specifications, orders or requests furnished
the affiant. Affiant further states that (s) he has made no payment directly or indirectly to any elected
official, officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any county or local subdivision of the state, of money
or any other thing of value to obtain or procure the contract or purchase order.

IR S S Al City of Lawton, Parks and Recreation /Drainage Maintenance

7
1 HOT&?!Y' ggg‘-‘cbsgﬂé ﬁ'TOK Business Name / Contractor Name

N3

‘
’
& UL E gl 19001291 4 )
i EXp. 02-04-2027 & N
AsmasimmimmasImanens /% P S —
- "
Sign‘sd'f'
Print : “Christine James

Attested to before me thisZ{ “day of QQ“:\ \ 2023

Notary %ubl% ;

My Commission Expires Q -~ Dd 2021

NOTE: Copy of this Affidavit must be attached to any invoice submitted by an architect, contractor, or

engineer or supplier for work, services, or materials completed or supplied under the terms of the contract
or contracts in excess of $25,000.00.

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 11 OF 11



Bid Number: CL23-016 Bid Title: Mowing & Litter Control

vendor Name:  City of Lawton, Park Maintenance and Drainage Maintenance Divisions
(please completed above information)

Price Sheet
(must be completed and returned with the bid)

Bid Option 1 Bid Option 2
X Monthly Cost to Provide
Monthly Ct_:st to I.’row-de ALL Requested Services
ONLY Mowing, Trimming )
. . Listed Under
and Litter Control Services . . . w
Specifications" from
from May - Oct M feb
Area Descriptions ay - re
Area 1: Major E-W Street Medians and Rights-of-Way $17,754.63 $17,754.63
Area 2: Major N-S Street Medians and Rights-of-Way $17,754.63 $17,754.63
Area 3: Neighborhood Medians $5,918.21 $5,918.21
Area 4: City Owned Vacant Lots $5,918.21 $5,918.21
Area S: City Facilities $5,918.21 $5,918.21
Area 6: Drainage Areas $41,020.17 $41,020.17

Any questions pertaining to the attached specifications, please contact Christine James at 580-581-3400 or christine.james@lawtonok.gov

Notes:
1. This is a requirements contract.

2. There are insurance requirements for this contract.
3. Please submit two copies of any additional documents such as descriptive literature.

DISCLAIMER: The City of Lawton reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.






City of Lawton

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
[ DIRECT INQUIRIES TO:

MAIL SEALED BIDS TO:
City Clerk iustine.quevara@lawtonok.gov
City of Lawton
212 SW gth Street QUESTIONS REGARDING BID:
Lawton, OK 73501 www . bidsync.com/bidsync-cas/
Date Bid Typed: Dates Bid Advertised: No Bids Received After:
April 12, 2023 April 14, 2023 May 2, 2023 2:00pm
Contract Number and Title: Requirements-type Contract: Contract Period:
CL23-026 Mowing & Litter 12 months
Bid Openings are held at Lawton City Hali 2nd Floor Conference Room

212 SW ot Street Lawton, OK 73501 @ 2:00 pm
Vendor Name and Point of Contact:

Sedt Buersy LLL. (L2702 Wosnig + & Horry

Reason for No Bid:

Mailing Address: Terms:
3o /S

Dunwert  Olta 73524

City: State: Zip: Delivery:

Drecart Qlele. 73353 “Mpny 2,202 3

Area Code and Phone Number: Email Address:
C3o-Hlo <85 SP@ jeffentercy e b

Federal Employer Identification Number or Social Security Number
BI-SIS 300!
THIS BID INVALID IF NOT SIGNED AND NOTARIZED

stateoF_ Olle. . COUNTY OF O prc e ‘

AFFIDAVIT:

‘SZ# E/“‘ 5y O AY 1‘1’“( /g 7 A’/A“—f of lawful age, being first duly swom, on oath says that:

ompetitive bid and executing the confract which is attached fo this

t has the authority to bind the bidder/vendor, whether an individual, partnership, or corporation, for the purpose of negotiating
and entering into said agreement, and for certifying the facts pertaining to the existence of collusion among bidders and between bidders and City officials or
employees, as well as facts pertaining to the giving or offering of things of value to government personnel in return for special consideration in the letting of any

s surrounding the making of the bid and/or the

contract pursuant to the bid to which this statement is attached; 2. Affiant is fully aware of the facts and circumstance:
is attached and has been personaily and directly involved in the proceedings leading to the submission of such

procurement of the contract to which this statement is a

bids; 3. Neither the bidder/v j been a party: a. to any collusion among bidders in restraint of
freedomn of competition by agreement to bid ata fixed price or to refrain from bidding, b. to any collusion with any municipal official or employee as to quantity, quality
or price in the prospective contract, or as to any other terms of such prospective contract, C. in any discussions between bidders and any municipal official concerning
exchange of money or other thing of value for special consideration in the letting of a contract, nor d. to paying, giving or donating or agreeing to pay, give or donate
to any officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any money or other thing of value, either directly or indirectly, in procuring the contract to which his statement is
attached. 4. Affiant further agrees to be held personally liable in the event that Affiant has misrepresented the scope or extend of Affiant’s authority to bind the bidder
herein, and fo indemnify and hold harmiess the City of Lawton its departments, boards, commissions, agencies, institutions, and all employees of the aforementioned
from all damages based upon such misrepresentation, including but not limited 1o ali costs and attorney fees incurred, in addition to any other remedies available by

1. Affiant is the duly authorized agent of the bidder/vendor and/or contractor submitting the c

statement, and that as such agent Affian

law.
- SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT
Fim: -Sp +H 'E(\l e g h@e é{‘k S
Afirees: IZ op //] PRINT/TYPE NAME/TITLE
,,'L/)Mra/( @ /C /6\ V4 7 S/ 3 ¢ / Subscribed & swom before me this _3__ day of Maj.f R 20__23_.
(City, State, Zip) %‘(Q’“‘(\\Cm N YOO W
Phone: %KU' { Lo~ S’_CZX' 8/ My Commission ex(;jires: q - l(gg%gg:(-é’

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
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AFFIDAVIT FOR PAYMENTS IN EXCESS OF $25,000.00
CITY OF LAWTON, STATE OF OKLAHOMA

sTaTEOF  OWlePamer

SS
COUNTY OF ( [=  aal e‘-

The undersigned (architect, contractor, supplier or engineer), of lawful age, being first duly swomn,
on oath says that this contract is true and correct. Affiant further states that the (work, services or materials)
will be (completed or supplied) in accordance with the plans, specifications, orders or requests furnished
the affiant. Affiant further states that (s) he has made no payment directly or indirectly to any elected
official, officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any county or local subdivision of the state, of money
or any other thing of value to obtain or procure the contract or purchase order.

Sedt Frersy  LLC.

Business Name / Contractor Name

Signed - QY ose Lol s

Print :
Attested to before me this 9\ day of MCLK:{J 2023
Rrooldu n manguan
Notary Pubhca \\“\“\nw’%’
SOIN 4///”//
My Commission Expires q - l (ﬂ 20 Mo o°,"“‘°TARy %
25 522012620

.
“m
3
h
(-]
@
-
-4
~
_."'

N

/,,"’aq"--. LTI

&

NOTE: Copy of this Affidavit must be attached to any invoice submitted by an arc
engineer or supplier for work, services, or materials completed or supplied under the terms of the contract

or contracts in excess of $25,000.00.

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 11 OF 11



Bid Number: CL23-016

Vendor Name:

Sedt Enersy LLC

Bid Title: Mowing & Litter Contr

(please completed above information)

Price Sheet

{must be completed and returned with the bid)

Area Descriptions

Bid Option 1

Monthly Cost to Provide
ONLY Mowing, Trimming
and Litter Control Services
from May - Oct

Bid Option 2

Monthly Cost to Provide
ALL Requested Services
Listed Under
"Specifications” from
May - Feb

Area 1: Major E-W Street Medians and Rights-of-Way

/5,000 " pne pound

171, ©®080 grer

e

Area 2: Major N-S Street Medians and Rights-of-Way

23,460 ;uy faam/

-
76,092 s rorned|

Area 3: Neighborhood Medians

[ 7,000 gpy ,uu»/

£%,900 " ore foy

e

Area 4: City Owned Vacant Lots

/S oo Me Omad

Area 5: City Facilities

/2000 5% round

[Tooo oM roun/

Area 6: Drainage Areas

19,600 s soudd

55,2942 “eme romd

(;70; GO0 18 Jow

Any questions pertaining to the attached specifications, please contact Christine James at 580-581-3400 or christine_james@lawtonok.gov

Notes:
1. This is a requirements contract.

2. There are insurance requirements for this contract.

3. Please submit two copies of any additional documents such as descriptive literature.

DISCLAIMER: The City of Lawton reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.



JETT E

ENERGY

PO.Box113
Duncan, OK 73534
Phone: (580) 470-5985

Email: sp@jettenergynet

Rate Schedule & General Information

Effective January 1, 2023



JETT

RSy

General Information

The attached schedule contains rates for manpower, equipment, and tools to be supplies by
Jett Energy, LLC for your projects.

Personnel rates are based on a normal 5 day/40 hour week beginning on Monday. Any work
performed before 7:00 a.m. or after 5:30 p.m. on weekdays and all work performed on
Saturdays and Sundays will be charged at the overtime rate of one and one-half time. All
Holidays will be charged at the overtime rate of double time.

Time begins and ends at contractor’s permanent or temporary yard or a designated assembly
point to be agreed upon between Contractor and Client.

There will be a three hour minimum charge on any service performed. Equipment requested to
remain on job site, will be charged a three hour minimum per day until released by customer.

Equipment and tolls with daily rates are based on a normal 10 hour work day.
Equipment brand will be “as stated” or equivalent from another manufacturer.

When projects require overnight lodging, a per diem rate of $90.00 per person, per night will be
charged. Any employee (i.e. welders) paid a daily per die rate will also be charged back to the
customer at the rate of $90.00 stated above. Per diem rate may be negotiated based on
geographic region or current IRS allowable rate.

Materials, rentals and third-party services provided by the Contractor will be at cost + 15%. This
will include, but is not limited to, permits, equipment, tools, and consumables such as paint,
brushes, cutting wheels, welding supplies, rags, etc. required in the performance of work.
Motorized rental equipment shall be charged a 30% markup to cover the cost of fuel.



Labor

Project Manager
Superintendent
Inspector

Foreman
Operator/Certified
Labor
Painter/Sandblaster
Skilled Laborer
Welder

Welder Helper
Truck Driver
Mechanic

Concrete Finisher
Hydrotest Technician

Roustabout

Heavy Equipment

Excavators

Backhoe 4x4

Excavator (equal to CAT 320)
Excavator (equal to CAT 315}
MID! Excavator

Mini Excavator

Hydraulic Hammer

Dozers

D-3 {(or equivalent}

D-5 {or equivalent)

D-6 {or equivalent}

$70.00/hr
$70.00/hr
$50.00/hr
$60.00/hr
$50.00/hr
$40.00/hr
$49.00/hr
$45.00/hr
$65.00/hr
$40.00/hr
$42.00/hr
$45.00/hr
$40.00/hr
$50.00/hr

$50.00/hr

$60.00/hr
$90.00/hr
$80.00/hr
$60.00/hr
$50.00/hr

Call for Quote

$65.00/hr
$80.00/hr

$90.00/hr



Additional Equipment

Motorgrader

3 CY Wheel Loader
Marooka

54" Padfoot Roller

60’ 4x4 Manlift

Rough Terrain Forklift (6-8K #)
Skid Steer

8’ Street Broom

Tractor w/ 12’ Brush Hog
Tractor w/ &’ Brush Hog
UTV/Side by Side

ATV 4x4

Misc. Power Equipment

Wood Chipper

Walk Behind Trench Rolier
Pressure Washer

Air Compressor 185p

Paint Rig

Sandblast Rig

Concrete Mixer

90# Jack Hammer

Jumping Jack Compactor
6000w Generator

Portable Light Tower

2" Trash Pump w/20’ hoses
3” Trash Pump w/20’ hoses
24” Plate Compactor

60" Zero Turn Mower

72" Zero Turn Mower

$70.00/hr
$60.00/hr
$55.00/hr
$55.00/hr
$50.00/hr
$45.00/hr
$45.00/hr
$35.00/hr
$45.00/hr
$35.00/hr
$30.00/hr

$15.00/hr

$35.00/hr
$40.00/hr
$40.00/hr
$25.00/hr
$15.00/hr
$18.00/hr
$15.00/hr
$15.00/hr
$18.00/hr
$100.00/day
$225.00/day
$85.00/day
$100.00/day
$150.00/day
$40.00/hr

$45.00/hr



Push Mower
Weed Eater

Chain Saw/Pole Saw

Trucks/Trailers

Bucket Truck

Welders Rig

Roustabout Truck w/ tools
Mechanic Truck

Pickup Truck

Haul Truck w/Lowboy

14’ Dump Trailer

500 Gallon Water Trailer
Gooseneck Trailer

Utility Trailer

Cargo Trailer

Misc. Tools/Equipment

Post Hole Digger w/ Auger
Box Blade

6’ Disk

8’ Harrow/Drag

Cone Seeder {(PTO type)
3" Pipe Threader

Hot Tap Machine (per tap)
Line-up Clamps

Beveling Machine

Cold Cutters

Skids (per 25)

Fire Extinguisher {if used)

Miscellaneous Hand Tools

Instruments/Electronics

$20.00/day
$25.00/day

$30.00/day

$35.00/hr
$30.00/hr
$40.00/hr
$30.00/hr
$25.00/hr
$75.00/hr
$25.00/hr
$20.00/hr
$15.00/hr
$10.00/hr

$10.00/hr

$80.00/day
$50.00/day
$65.00/day
$35.00/day
$40.00/day
$145.00/day
$250.00/each
$30.00/day
$75.00/day
$75.00/day
$12.50/day
$65.00/each

$20.00/day



Holiday Detector/Jeep $65.00/day
4-Gas Monitor $32.00/day
Line Locator $45.00/day
Cathodics Testing Instrumentation $50.00/day

Transit w/Tripod $65.00/day

Other Services Offered

*License Commercial Spray Application

Specializing in Road Crossings, Station & Right-of-way Herbicide Control
*professional Building/Office Cleaning

Satisfaction Guaranteed

*Hydro Testing

Includes Certified Technicians and Instrumentation

Note: We have various other types of equipment and tools in our inventory that may not be
listed herin; Please call or email for further information and pricing.



Jett Energy would like to submit a few references that we are doing work for now.

Chris Hays @ Hays Production. 580-656-1602
Buddy Holt @ Enerfin Resources. 405-584-7413

Travis Cundiff @ NGL Resources. 405-880-0157

The Company’s and names listed above lett Energy is currently mowing and spraying and maintaining
facilities in Oklahoma.

Thank you

SE/






City of Lawton
INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT

MAIL SEALED BIDS TO:
City Clerk
City of Lawton
212 SW gth Street
Lawton, OK 73501

DIRECT INQUIRIES TO:
justine.guevara@lawtonok.gov

QUESTIONS REGARDING BID:
www.bidsync.com/bidsync-cas/

Date Bid Typed: Dates Bid Advertised: No Bids Received After:

April 12, 2023 April 14, 2023 May 2, 2023 2:00pm
Contract Number and Title: Requirements-type Contract: Contract Period:
CL23-026 Mowing & Litter 12 months

Bid Openings are held at Lawton City Hall 2nd Floor Conference Room
212 SW 9% Street Lawton, OK 73501 @ 2:00 pm

GHAE RO 8 Challergts
ollahoma - Hrnan WAL

Reason for No Bid:

934~ NwW tache Hd Nt 15

Enacl
Email Address:

Hrion. MoNrdL @O\Urxmafm(&’ge.com

Ooacne Ol F3537F

Area Code and Phone Number:

5%0- 25(- FU4F

Federal Employer Identification Number or Social Security Number

*%- (224027

THIS BID INVALID IF NOT SIGNED AND NOTARIZED
AFFIDAVIT: STATE OF OK-«'(U/\O AL COUNTY OF ( o QG NCUNE :

A
V) Y\ OW\ VV\D Y\{ 0 e/ of lawful age, being first duly swom, on oath says that:

1. Affiant is the duly authorized agent of the bidder/vendor and/or contractor submitting the competitive bid and executing the contract which is attached to this
statement, and that as such agent Affiant has the authority to bind the bidder/vendor, whether an individual, partnership, or corporation, for the purpose of negotiating
and entering into said agreement, and for certifying the facts pertaining to the existence of collusion among bidders and between bidders and City officials or
employees, as well as facts pertaining to the giving or offering of things of value to govemment personnel in retum for special consideration in the letting of any
contract pursuant to the bid to which this statement is attached; 2. Affiant is fully aware of the facts and circumstances surrounding the making of the bid and/or the
procurement of the contract to which this statement is attached and has been personally and directly involved in the proceedings leading to the submission of such
bids: 3. Neither the bidder/vendor nor anyone subject to the bidderfvendor’s direction or control has been a party: a. to any collusion among hidders in restraint of
freedom of competition by agreement to bid at a fixed price or to refrain from bidding, b. to any collusion with any municipal official or employee as to quantity, quality
or price in the prospective contract, or as to any other terms of such prospective contract, ¢. in any discussions between bidders and any municipal official conceming
exchange of money or other thing of value for special consideration in the letting of a contract, nor d. to paying, giving or donating or agreeing to pay, give or donate
to any officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any money or other thing of value, either directly or indirectly, in procuring the contract to which his statement is
attached. 4. Affiant further agrees to be held personally liable in the event that Affiant has misrepresented the scope or extend of Affiant’s authority to bind the bidder
herein, and to indemnify and hold harmless the City of Lawton its departments, boards, commissions, agencies, institutions, and all employees of the aforementioned

from all damages based upon such misrepresentation, including but not limited to %mey fees incurred, in addition to any other remedies available by
law. \ %{

SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT

am Stise. bl €T Unallige. brian Mnge-Neadkion Do’
Address: |QM} M v\_) pa[hf m Subscribed & sworn befo r:: l:iT,TYPE g Yol zoﬂ.
(Glne, OY. 252+ 300 o, =

“(City, State, Zip)
My Commission expires: QS v

Phone: F)-Y_D' %q l' wq"

o
PO >
5 (2
£ 107220105, 02
INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT £ Sﬁ?mx,@i% =
PAGE 1 OF 11 20 N
5'/\ . U =
AN 7 ‘o
FORM REVISED 2/14/22 “o BLIC . W&
Y4, F O- LA“R\“



AFFIDAVIT FOR PAYMENTS IN EXCESS OF $25,000.00
CITY OF LAWTON, STATE OF OKLAHOMA

STATE OF

oancne

The undersigned (architect, contractor, supplier or engineer), of lawful age, being first duly sworn,
on oath says that this contract is true and correct. Affiant further states that the (work, services or materials)
will be (completed or supplied) in accordance with the plans, specifications, orders or requests furnished
the affiant. Affiant further states that (s) he has made no payment directly or indirectly to any elected
official, officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any county or local subdivision of the state, of money

or any other thing of value to ob‘tai'rll' or procure the contract or purchase order.
g3t Hig ’

SRR Qo Kyl e Toen tralle ge

Business Name / Contractor Name

Ao PUBLNZOS

lsaiilte? g/‘/ an Moo/‘o e
Attested to before me this 2}«( day of ﬁ(PVl ‘ 20&3 -
Qe na Mield Pone

Notary Public

My Commission Expires OK ! O l ZOZ_(Q

COUNTY OF

NOTE: Copy of this Affidavit must be attached to any invoice submitted by an architect, contractor, or

engineer or supplier for work, services, or materials completed or supplied under the terms of the contract
or contracts in excess of $25,000.00.

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 11 OF 11



Bid Number: CL23-016 Bid Title: Mowing & Litter Contr

Vendor Name: SOYL ﬂge/ M U_J.‘k Tﬂm M‘énﬁg/

{please completed above |nformat|on)

Price Sheet
{must be completed and returned with the bid)

Bid Option 1 Bid Option 2

Monthly Cost to Provide

Monthly Cost to Provide ALL Requested Services

ONLY Mowing, Tnmm.mg Listed Under
and Litter Control Services "Specifications” from
from May - Oct P

Area Descriptions May - Feb

Area 1: Major E-W Street Medians and Rights-of-Way Y 08,500 $5¢ 500
Area 2: Major -5 Street Medians and Rights-of-Way Yra,200 | 350 100
Area 3: Neighborhood Medians 3 1y, 900 4y, 100
Area 4: City Owned Vacant Lots N @ 4900 ¥ (p, ddO
ron: e No Y10 NO HTD
Area 6: Drainage Areas NO D NO BID |

Any guestions pertaining to the attached specifications, please contact Christine James at 580-581-3400 or christine.james@lawtonok.gov

Notes:
1. This is a requirements contract.

2. There are insurance requirements for this contract.
3. Please submit two copies of any additional documents such as descriptive literature.

DISCLAIMER: The City of Lawton reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.






City of Lawton
INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT

MAIL SEALED BIDS TO: DIRECT INQUIRIES TO:

City Clerk justine.quevara@lawtonok.gov

City of Lawton

212 SW 9th Street QUESTIONS REGARDING BID:

Lawton, OK 73501 www.bidsync.com/bidsync-cas/
Date Bid Typed: Dates Bid Advertised: No Bids Received After:
April 12, 2023 April 14, 2023 May 2, 2023 2:00pm
Contract Number and Title: Requirements-type Contract: Contract Period:
CL23-026 Mowing & Litter 12 months

Bid Openings are held at Lawton City Hall 2nd Floor Conference Room
212 SW 9% Street Lawton, OK 73501 @ 2:00 pm

BNURIL-L G\ G -
PO ¥ o N ﬁaeﬂ.%
%ﬁh%mberj ')Ng ))q Eg}l ‘Rt)l\;r’es/s““ V\(./

SO ME1-KHA20 '*?WmQY@ﬁ”\ANQK\Q @

Federal Employer Identification Number or Social Security Number

Rl 11RO

" THIS BID INVALID IF NOT SIGNED AND NOTARIZED
AFFIDAVIT: STATE OF § )K \& N~ COUNTY OF \_ D hn\{\ 2

/ !
l = MM M\\ \Rh-\ of lawful age, being first duly swomn, on oath says that:

1. Affant is the duly authorized agent of the biddervendor andfor contractor submitting the competitive bid and exetuting the contract which is attached to this
statement, and that as such agent Affiant has the authority to bind the bidderfvendor, whether an individual, partnership, or corporation, for the purpose of negotiating
and entering into said agreement, and for certrfymg the facts pertaining to the existence of collusion among bidders and between bidders and City officials or
employees, as well as facts pertaining to the glvmg or offering of things of value to government personnel in return for special consideration in the letting of any
contract pursuant to the bid to which this statement is attached; 2. Affiant is fully aware of the facts and circumstances surrounding the making of the bid and/or the
procurement of the confract to which this statement is attached and has been personally and directly involved in the proceedings leading to the submission of such
bids; 3. Neither the bidder/vendor nor anyone subject to the bidder/vendor's direction or contral has been a party: a. to any collusion among bidders in restraint of
freedom of competition by agreement to bid at a fixed price or to refrain from bidding, b. to any collusion with any municipal officiai or employee as to quantity, quakty
or price In the prospective contract, or as fo any other terms of such prospactive contract, ¢. in any discussions between tidders and any municipal official conceming
exchange of money or other thing of value for special consideration in the letting of a contract, nor d. to paying, giving or donatmg or agreeing to pay, give or donate
to any officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any money or other thing of value, either directly or indirectly, in procuring the contract to which his statement is
attached. 4, Affiant further agrees to be held personally liable in the event that Affiant has misrepresented the scope or extend of Affiant’s authority to bind the bidder
herein, and to indemnify and hold hammless the City of Lawton its departments, boards, commi 8, agencies, institutions, and all employees of the aforementioned
from all damages based upon such misrepresentation, including but not limited to all co nda ey fees incurred, in addition to any other remedies available by
law,

SlGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT
fme LY L \\ewz‘x(’%ﬁ«\(@»@m\ W ‘TF' W\ AN T 0 wntr
Address: PO @\n 27 k*\ '
Duarean Q¥ 13K 4

(City, State, Zip)

Phone: S QQ [ l“ Bq "‘gl‘* %\D My Commision expires:

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 1 OF 11

RASHELLE D. EVERETT
Notary Public - State of Oklahoma

FORM REVISED 2/14/22 Commission Number 15006464

4 My Commission Expires Jul 15, 2023




AFFIDAVIT FOR PAYMENTS IN EXCESS OF $25,000.00
CITY OF LAWTON, STATE OF OKLAHOMA

STATE OF b\K\ M\ow\a

couNTY OF {_srautine

S8

The undersigned (architect, contractor, supplier or engineer), of lawful age, being first duly sworn,
on oath says that this contract is true and correct. Affiant further states that the (work, services or materials)
will be (completed or supplied) in accordance with the plans, specifications, orders or requests furnished
the affiant. Affiant further states that (s) he has made no payment directly or indirectly to any elected
official, officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any county or local subdivision of the state, of money
or any other thing of value to obtain or procure the contract or purchase order.

TR e SR\ ¢ mguan -

Business Name / Contractor Name
S

l> W\\\

A

Slgnq

Tara YW\ ot~

Attested to before me this ()-“d _~W day of %M W
RASHELLE D. EVERETT

Naotary Public - State of Oklahoma

o 'y Public
Commission Number 15006464

My Commission Expires Jul 15, 2023 fy Commission Expires 2

NOTE: Copy of this Affidavit must be attached to any invoice submitted by an architect, contractor, or
engineer or supplier for work, services, or materials completed or supplied under the terms of the contract
or contracts in excess of $25,000.00.

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 11 OF 11



CITY OF LAWTON
212 SW 9t Street
Lawton, Oklahoma 73501
(580) 581-3500

CONTRACTOR'’S CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE
WITH NON-DISCRIMINATION PROVISIONS OF THE CONTRACT

In accordance with the provisions of this Contract relating to non-discrimination, it is hereby certified that I/we have
compihied with the provisions of Section 1U-1-112 of the Code of Urdimances of the Uity of Lawton i the performance of

any work in connection with this Contract.

(L3202 e+l Comgeng B

Contract Number Name of Contractor (Print)

S ]i)\ \:@15

Date ’ \ Signature, M}mber of Firm.ér Officer of Corporation

() WL R

Title




Bid Number: C123-016

Bid Title: Mowing & Litter Contr

Vendor Name: q Y\l\ \'\G\N& *_ (_F:W\E) <_,0"V\ f] G\NV\ \\\E\C

Area Descriptions

{please completed above information)

Price Sheet

{must be completed and returned with the bid)

Bid Option 1

Monthly Cost to Provide
ONLY Mowing, Trimming
and Litter Control Services

ABmor n

Eremrnn
I IVIGY C Wl

Bid Option 2

Monthly Cost to Provide
ALL Requested Services
Listed Under
"Specifications” from
May - Feb

Area 1: Major E-W Street Medians and Rights-of-Way

N

N

Area 2: Major N-S Street Medians and Rights-of-Way

N

N/ai

Area 3: Neighborhood Medians

Ny

(\s

Area 4: City Owned Vacant Lots

pawSalt

N Slob

Area 5: City Facilities

4

N 3’?@%«3

SS 37{)\ Mo\l

Area 6: Drainage Areas

H S
A IO bl

114,899, e

Any questions nertaining to the atrached specifications, please contact Christine James at 580-581-3400 or christine james@iawtonai gov

Notes:

1. This is a requirements contract.
2. There are insurance requirements for this contract,

3. Please submit twa copies of any additional documents such as descriptive literature.

DISCLAIMER: The City of Lawton reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.







City of Lawton
INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT

MAIL SEALED BIDS TO: DIRECT INQUIRIES TO:

City Clerk justine.guevara@lawtonok.qov

City of Lawton

212 SW 6th Street QUESTIONS REGARDING BID:

Lawton, OK 73501 www.bidsync.com/bidsync-cas/
Date Bid Typed: Dates Bid Advertised: No Bids Recelved After:
April 12, 2023 April 14, 2023 May 2, 2023 2:00pm
Contract Number and Title: Requirements-type Contract: Contract Period:
CL23-026 Mowing & Litter 12 months

Bid Openings are held at Lawton City Hall 2nd Floor Conference Room
212 SW 9" Street Lawton, OK 73501 @ 2:00 pm

oo WL -
OO0, Pax ¥4 7y W <!
;\r}c\;\d‘:;n-tzg &m&erSBLL Emait A\gizss PV\L\<
Sgb %rw —%3\0 "ft‘x p @ »\QSY 'I'Nég \\Ll( Dh"\

Fedeftmployer Identifi ctn Number or Social Security Number

~ \ %6009

THIS BID INVALID IF NOT SIGNED AND NOTARIZED
AFFIDAVIT: STATE OF C ) ﬂ &A hm COUNTY OF Ca TG e L\’\ [ i

Al
fall ey W\\ L \A}"\ of lawful age, being first duly swom, on oath says that:

1. Affiant is the duly authorized agent of the bidderivendor and/or contractor submitting the competitive bid and exscuting the contract which is altached to this
staternent, and that as such agent Affiant has the authority to bind the bidder/vendor, whether an individual, partnership, or corporation, for the purpose of negotiating
and entering into said agreement, and for certifying the facts pertaining to the existence of collusion among bidders and between bidders and City officials or
employees, as well as facts pertaining to the glving ot offering of things of value to government personnel in return for special consideration in the letting of any
contract pursuant to the bid to which this statement is attached; 2. Affiant is fully aware of the facts and circumstances surrounding the making of the bid and/or the
procurement of the contract to which this statement is attached and has been personally and directly involved in the proceedings leading to the submission of such
bids; 3. Neither the bidder/vendor nor anyone subject io the bidder/vendor’s direction or controf has been a party: a. to any collusion among bidders in restraint of
freedom of competition by agreement to bid at a fixed price or to refrain from bidding, b. to any collusion with any municipal official or employee as to quantity, quabty
or price in the prospective contract, or 25 1o any other tens of such prospective contract, ¢. in any discussions between bidders and any municipal official conceming
exchange of money or other thing of value for specual consideration in the letting of a contract, nor d. to paying, giving or donating or agreeing to pay, give or donate
to any officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any money or cther thing of value, either directly or indirectly, in procuring the contract to which his statement is
attached. 4. Affiant further agrees to be held personally fiable in the event that Affiant has misrepresented the scope or extend of Affiant’s authority to bind the bidder
herein, and to indemnify and hold harmless the City of Lawton its departments, boards, commissions\ agencies, institutions, and all employees of the aforementioned
from all damages based upon such misrepresentation, including but not fimited to all costs and attal fees incurred, in addition to any other remedies available by

law.

\ SIGN f\T}aRE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT

irm: <::,\ L»\)rmu.s \—\\\C/ J{n\PWX Lo | Oonee
Address: m @) L’)\(?lq_ ) R|N_ ﬁ Y
Durcan (")I( DY

(City, Stats, Zip)

Phone; S 8(5 L\ B'}_ % L‘"& My Commission expires: {

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 1 OF 11

RASHELLE D. EVERETT

Notary Public - State of Oklahoma
FORM REVISED 2/14/22 Commission Number 15006464

My Commission Expires Jul 15, 2023




AFFIDAVIT FOR PAYMENTS IN EXCESS OF $25,000.00
CITY OF LAWTON, STATE OF OKLAHOMA

STATE OF @&\ R\\DM

COUNTY OF ( core—cnc s

S8

The undersigned (architect, contractor, supplier or engineer), of lawful age, being first duly swom,
on oath says that this confract is true and correct. Affiant further states that the (work, services or materials)
will be (completed or supplied) in accordance with the plans, specifications, orders or requests furnished
the affiant. Affiant further states that (s) he has made no payment directly or indirectly to any elected
official, officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any county or local subdivision of the state, of money
or any other thing of value to obtain or procure the contract or purchase order.

S 0\\’\\“\0\4_(, L\-\&

Business Name / Contractor Name

B

Sign
¥ ak\ l’Y\ \\N—\

Attested to before me this /I\Y\d day of m“% ‘ m M

RASHELLE D. EVERETT Nobdry Public

Notary Public - State of Oklahoma
Commission Number 15006464 .. .
My Commission Expires Jul 15, 2023 My Commission Expires 20 /.

NOTE: Copy of this Affidavit must be attached to any invoice submitted by an architect, contractor, or
engineer or supplier for work, services, or materials completed or supplied under the terms of the contract
or contracts in excess of $25,000.00.

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 11 OF 11



CITY OF LAWTON
212 SW 9% Street
Lawton, Oklahoma 73501
(580) 581-3500

CONTRACTOR’S CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE
WITH NON-DISCRIMINATION PROVISIONS OF THE CONTRACT

In accordance with the provisions of this Contract relating to non-discrimination, it is hereby certified that Ifwe have
complied with the provisions of Section 10-1-11Z of the Code ot Urdinances of the ity of Lawton in the performance of

any work in connection with this Contract.

(Ao -2 Sb\\r\jﬁ\oh& LLC

Confract Number Name of Contractor (Print)

< ot b, /qj{

Date | \ Signatuch Member oF Firm or Officer of Corporation

|1

O wyier

Title




Bid Number: CL23-016

Vendor Name:

olviligne WAV

Bid Title: Mowing & Litter Contr

{please completed above information)

Price Sheet

{must be completed and returned with the bid)

Area Descriptions

Bid Option 1

Monthly Cost to Provide
ONLY Mowing, Trimming
and Litter Controf Servi:es

from Moy -

Bid Option 2

Monthly Cost to Provide
ALL Requested Services
Listed Under
"Specifications” from
May - Feb

Area 1: Major E-W Street Medians and Rights-of-Way

VR

Nied

Area 2: Major N-S Street Medians and Rights-of-Way

V)

N e

Area 3: Neighborhood Medians

N

~Rd

Area 4: City Owned Vacant Lots

1213 m

P \ <22%

Area 5: City Facilities

i
e

35 3% S

Area 6: Drainage Areas

"o G202

Y, b6 2

Any questions pertaining to the attached specifications, please contact Christine James at 580-581-3400 or christine james@iawtonok gov

Notes:
1. This is a requirements contract.

2. There are insurance requirements for this contract.

3. Please submit two capies of any additional documents such as descriptive literature.

DISCLAIMER: The City of Lawton reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.







City of Lawton
INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT

MAIL SEALED BIDS TO: DIRECT INQUIRIES TO:

City Clerk justine.guevara@lawtonok.qov

City of Lawton

212 SW 9th Street QUESTIONS REGARDING BID:

Lawton, OK 73501 www.bidsync.com/bidsync-cas/
Date Bid Typed: Dates Bid Advertised: No Bids Received After:
April 12, 2023 April 14, 2023 May 2, 2023 2:00pm
Contract Number and Title: Requirements-type Contract: Contract Period:
CL23-026 Mowing & Litter 12 months

Bid Openings are held at Lawton City Hall 2nd Floor Conference Room
212 SW 9V Street Lawton, OK 73501 @ 2:00 pm

Vendor Name and Point of Contact: Reason for No Bid:
WMot Shet Seeteas WG
Mailing Address: Terms:
PO, ax 7Y 0 Racei?
Ari} Ckg;‘;{n.;\ ;;onec:l?mg'er: ’_) 9}3_\3} U\ OA\m‘ldres&; - V\(Xk
S RO~ U;L{ - ?'\ID\Q _ kmm}m)‘ﬁ-\me\\c‘mw\
Federal Employer ident on Number or Social Security Number '

6 - 11U

THIS BID INVALID [F NOT SIGNED AND NOTARIZED
AFFIDAVIT: STATE OF O K\‘A I’\O’N\ A COUNTY OF (Q DG L_l\ 6

/\T?\W\\ \’\lf\\'\ \R“'\ of lawfut age, being first duly swom, on oath says that:

1. Affiant is the duly authorized agent of the bidder/vendor and/or contractor submitting the competitive bid and exscuting the contract which is attached o this
staternent, and that as such agent Affiant has the authority to bind the bidder/vendor, whether an individual, partnership, or corporation, for the purpose of negotiating
and entering into said agreement, and for certifying the facts pertaining to the existence of collusion ameong bidders and between bidders and City officials or
employees, as well as facts pertaining to the giving or offering of things of value to government personniel in return for special consideration in the letting of any
contract pursuant to the bid to which this statement is attached; 2. Affiant is fully aware of the facts and circumstances surrounding the making of the bid and/or the
procurement of the contract to which this statement is attached and has been personally and directly involved in the proceedings leading to the submission of such
bids; 3. Neither the bidder/vendor nor anyone subject to the bidderivendor’s direction or control has been a party: a. to any collusion among bidders in restraint of
freedom of competition by agreement to bid at a fixed price or to refrain from bidding, b. to any collusion with any municipal official or employee as to quantity, quality
or price in the prospective contract, or as to any cther terms of such prospective contract, ¢. in any discussions between bidders and any municipal official conceming
exchange of money or other thing of value for special consideration in the leting of a contract, nor d. to paying, giving or donating or agreeing to pay, give or donate
to any officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any money or other thing of value, either directly or indirectly, in procuring the contract to which his statement is
attached. 4. Affiant further agrees to be held personally liable in the event that Affiant has misrepresented the scope or extend of Affiant's authority to bind the bidder
herein, and to indemnify and hold harmless the City of Lawton its departments, boards, commissions, dgencies, institutions, and all employees of the aforementioned
from all damages based upon such misrepresentation, including but not Emited to all costs and attomeWfees incurred, in addition to any other remedies avaitable by
law.

g

o . Shi Geetens LIE A “f’“T’ Sl
Address:_ 10, ﬂi\h\l‘ %r—)q y

e B TR ]
Douncaas Sk sy @mm *

!
Phone: 5 ?C) Lk ‘i)q %L‘ D\Q My Commission expires: ()u.‘ﬂjum.l%

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 1 OF 11

RASHELLE D. EVERETT
Notary Public - State of Oklahoma

FORM REVISED 2/14/22 Commission Number 15006464
My Commission Expires Jul 15, 2023




AFFIDAVIT FOR PAYMENTS IN EXCESS OF $25,000.00
CITY OF LAWTON, STATE OF OKLAHOMA

STATE OF Dk\ALDM

COUNTY OF(_ oy enet his

S8

The undersigned (architect, contractor, supplier or engineer), of lawful age, being first duly sworn,
on oath says that this contract is true and corvect. Affiant further states that the {work, services or materials)
will be (completed or supplied) in accordance with the plans, specifications, orders or requests furnished
the affiant. Affiant further states that (s) he has made no payment directly or indirectly to any elected
official, officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any county or local subdivision of the state, of money
or any other thing of value to obtain or procure the contract or purchase order.

AQBY qf\ \” gewtucs LLL

Business Name / Contractor Name

et o W\

Attested to before me this %d day Ofm
i

No Public

RASHELLE D. EVERETT
Notary Public - State of Oklahoma . . ( \l u ’ 5 )
Commission Number 15006464 ply Commission Expires \ ] 20

My Commission Expires Jul 15, 2023

NOTE: Copy of this Affidavit must be attached to any invoice submitted by an architect, contractor, or
engineer or supplier for work, services, or materials completed or supplied under the terms of the contract
or contracts in excess of $25,000.00.

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 11 OF 11



CITY OF LAWTON
212 SW 9% Street
Lawton, Oklahoma 73501
(580) 581-3500

CONTRACTOR’S CERTIFICATE OF COMPLIANCE
WITH NON-DISCRIMINATION PROVISIONS OF THE CONTRACT

In accordance with the provisions of this Contract relating to non-discrimination, it is hereby certified that I/we have
comphied with the provisions ot Section TU-1-T1Z of the Code ot Uriimances of the Uity of Lawton in the performance of

any work in connection with this Contract.

QL3 Db Ak Chot Srvtess LLC

Contract Number Name of Contractor {Print)

< lz\\ \3@3\5

Date \ Signature, ﬂrember of Firm or Officer of Corporation

O \r\\\\-&(\

Title



Bid Number: CL23-016

Vendor Name:

Bid Title: Mowing & Litter Contr

\\ - g‘kﬁv Servicee LLC

{please completed above information)

Price Sheet

{must be completed and returned with the bid})

Area Descriptions

Bid Option 1

Monthly Cost to Provide
ONLY Mowing, Trimming
and Litter Control Services
from Moy - Oct

Bid Option 2

Monthly Cost to Provide
ALL Requested Services
Listed Under
“Specifications” from
May - Feb

Area 1: Major E-W Street Medians and Rights-of-Way

™R,

N R

Area 2: Major N-S Street Medians and Rights-of-Way

VR

N ()

Area 3: Neighborhood Medians

Nl

V(R

Area 4: City Owned Vacant Lots

‘Y \Q, \\ob/mx\q

Area 5: City Facilities

-

< Dt

Area 6: Drainage Areas

1}0! 3R \«m)EL

Notes:
1. This is a requirements contract.

2. There are insurance requirements for this contract.

TS

Any guestions pertaining te the attached specifications, piease contact Christine James at 580-5%1-2400 or christine

3. Please submit twa capies of any additional documents such as descriptive literature.

DISCLAIMER: The City of Lawton reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.

T,

jlames@{awtonok.gov






City of Lawton
INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT

MAIL SEALED BIDS TO: DIRECT INQUIRIES TO:
City Clerk justine.quevara@lawtonok.gov
City of Lawton
212 SW 9th Street QUESTIONS REGARDING BID:
Lawton, OK 73501 www.bidsync.com/bidsync-cas/
Date Bid Typed: Dates Bid Advertised: No Bids Received After:
April 12, 2023 April 14, 2023 May 2, 2023 2:00pm
Contract Number and Title: Requirements-type Contract: Contract Period:

CL23-026 Mowing & Litter

Bid Openings are held at Lawton City Hall 2nd Floor Conference Room
212 SW 9" Street Lawton, OK 73501 @ 2:00 pm

12 months

Vendor Name and Point of Contact: Reason for No Bid:
s W zAa \2\
Mailing Address: Terms:

ale) MUL) NG AVETCAVN] P\«-QQ.E

City: State: Zip: Delivery:
Lasto N Ok 12507
Area Code and Phone Number: Email Address:

o
SEO -SLH"KOE |
Federal Employer identification Number or Social Security Number

2lo- OS5 0024
THIS BID INVALID IF NOT SIGNED AND NOTARIZED
AFFIDAVIT: state oF _OKLAMO VA COUNTY OF T Ya N

‘16’\_& (/L’ﬁ_fLI c‘“mi?___ M ‘ \.__.(-3_____,_\7 of lawful age, being first duly sworn, on oath says that:

1. Affiant is the duly authorized agent of the bidder/vendor and/or contractor submitth the competitive bid and executing the contract which is attached to this
statement, and that as such agent Affiant has the authority to bind the bidder/vendor, whether an individual, partnership, or corporation, for the purpose of negotiating
and entering into said agreement, and for certifying the facts pertaining to the existence of collusion among bidders and between bidders and City officials or
employees, as well as facts pertaining to the giving or offering of things of value to government personnel in return for special consideration in the letting of any
contract pursuant to the bid to which this statement is attached; 2. Affiant is fully aware of the facts and circumstances surrounding the making of the bid and/or the
procurement of the contract to which this statement is attached and has been personally and directly involved in the proceedings leading to the submission of such
bids; 3. Neither the bidder/vendor nor anyone subject to the bidder/vendor’s direction or control has been a party: a. to any collusion among bidders in restraint of
freedom of competition by agreement to bid at a fixed price or to refrain from bidding, b. to any collusion with any municipal official or employee as to quantity, quality
or price in the prospective contract, or as to any other terms of such prospective contract, c. in any discussions between bidders and any municipal official concerning
exchange of money or other thing of value for special consideration in the letting of a contract, nor d. to paying, giving or donating or agreeing to pay, give or donate
to any officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any money or ather thing of value, either directly or indirectly, in procuring the contract to which his statement is
attached. 4. Affiant further agrees to be held personally liable in the event that Affiant has misrepresented the scope or extend of Affiant's authority to bind the bidder
herein, and to indemnify and hold harmless the City of Lawton its departments, boards, commissions, agencies, institutions, and all employees of the aforementioned

from all damages based upon such misrepresentation, including but not limited to all c@ney{ses incurred, in addition to any other remedies available by
i

law.

SIGNATURE OF AUTHORIZED AGENT

Firm: (,,A'KS..)M Ad LAQb ",Mt: (I‘\l’lC{Aﬂe \“LF\\L'.‘: \f Q}QW
= PRINT/TYPE NAME/TITLE
Address:_\ 1O (\\\k\ LAKG\ (&) \_j_r\'{'-u S‘/ MG \‘? 35
Subscribed & beft t d f ~J , 20 .
}_ ;-:\‘\} TAD’\J '-'.\)L j )j(__i\ u & el : rSWOITI A%e ore mezﬁ ay o
(City, State, Zip) h\ U\fmﬁ_ U
- o Not P bii
Phone: 6?\10 - 5 Z 3 . (?{‘ C_)(KQ“I. My Commission expires: can Tt }0 ’; 7 3
INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT " NOTARY PUBLIC State of OK 4
PAGE 1 OF 11 : AMANDA ROACH !
¥ Comm # 11009838
FORM REVISED 2/14/22 ! Expires 10-27-2023 '



AFFIDAVIT FOR PAYMENTS IN EXCESS OF $25,000.00
CITY OF LAWTON, STATE OF OKLAHOMA

STATE OO o A
COUNTY OF £ O s a5

SS

The undersigned (architect, contractor, supplier or engineer), of lawful age, being first duly sworn,
on oath says that this contract is true and correct. Affiant further states that the (work, services or materials)
will be (completed or supplied) in accordance with the plans, specifications, orders or requests furnished
the affiant. Affiant further states that (s) he has made no payment directly or indirectly to any elected
official, officer or employee of the City of Lawton, any county or local subdivision of the state, of money
or any other thing of value to obtain or procure the contract or purchase order.

L_ooahy w (z,i\.{ZC\

Bﬁsines‘smme—/(jonﬁctomaﬁg )

0L

Signed

Print : 26&:: st AL - R LE\}

Attested to before me this Igjj day of /(N 20&5.
Wmanda  Laae 4

Notary Public
My Commission Expires _ﬂ’;n 20&).

AL M ARUBRB ARV T BB TR S

- NOTARY PUBLIC State of OK ’
; AMANDA ROACH ’
! Comm # 11009838
¢+ Expires 10-27-2‘023‘:

NOTE: Copy of this Affidavit must be attached to any invoice submitted by an architect, contractor, or

engineer or supplier for work, services, or materials completed or supplied under the terms of the contract
or contracts in excess of $25,000.00.

INVITATION TO BID AND CONTRACT
PAGE 11 OF 11



Bid Number: (CL23-016

Vendor Name:

LAGONS Lo 1@

Bid Title: Mowing & Litter Contr

(please completed above information)

Price Sheet

Area Descriptions

{must be completed and returned with the bid)

Bid Option 1

Monthly Cost to Provide
ONLY Mowing, Trimming
and Litter Control Services
from May - Oct

Bid Option 2

Monthly Cost to Provide
ALL Requested Services
Listed Under
"Specifications” from
May - Feb

Area 1: Major E-W Street Medians and Rights-of-Way Sf (Oq L\Q‘)Q‘ SN gj LDO \ Q\Q ©0
: T 3N {
Area 2: Major N-S Street Medians and Rights-of-Way ”Qé 6 SJQQ -ﬂ 5 200
Z , OO0

( ¢ |
Area 3: Neighborhood Medians i‘t[ *‘} S Q‘ oo _‘i/ (.D SCDC) OOy
Area 4: City Owned Vacant Lots &/ (ol wle) O g 5 Z 5 ) 600
Area 5: City Facilities MO E) (5 I\\Q E] '()
Area 6: Drainage Areas (&Q E\ B

- No®re

Any questions pertaining to the attached specifications, please contact Christine James at 580-581-3400 or christine.james@lawtonok.gov

Notes:
1. This is a requirements contract.

2. There are insurance requirements for this contract.

3. Please submit two copies of any additional documents such as descriptive literature.

DISCLAIMER: The City of Lawton reserves the right to accept or reject any or all bids.



